COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: C-21017
SUBJECT: Instrument Rental Program
DATE: 5/12/2020
SCHOOL/DEPT: Fine Arts
AWARDED TO: Band Instruments to Palen Music and Orchestra Instruments to Jerry's Instrument Rental
EST. Palen Music -Columbia, MO The Music Suite -Columbia, MO Jerry's Instrument Shop -Columbia, MO
INSTRUMENT Total for 3 Total for 3 Total for 3
QTY BRAND Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 years for all BRAND Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 years for all BRAND Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 years for all
instruments instruments instruments
BASS ' size 2 Canonici or Maple Leaf] $61.95 $58.95 $55.95 $3,537.00 Knilling Sebastian $100.00 $50.00 $30.00 $3,600.00 Eastman VB95 $143.00 $57.00 N/A $4,000.00
BASS % size 3 Canonici or Maple Leaf] $61.95 $58.95 $55.95 $5,305.50 Knilling Sebastian $100.00 $50.00 $30.00 $5,400.00 Eastman VB95 $143.00 $57.00 N/A $6,000.00
ICELLO ' size 1 Canonici or Maple Leaf] $39.95 $36.95 $33.95 $1,108.50 Knilling Sebastian $40.00 $25.00 $25.00 $900.00 Eastman VC95 $60.00 $24.00 N/A $840.00
CELLO % size 3 Canonici or Maple Leaf|  $39.95 $36.95 $33.95 $3,325.50 E““’g:s:gﬁ:;“‘"g $70.00 $40.00 $30.00 | $4.200.00 Eastman VC95 $60.00 $24.00 N/A $2,520.00
CELLO full size 2 Canonici or Maple Leaf|  $39.95 $36.95 $33.95 $2,217.00 E““’g:s:gﬁ:;“‘"g $70.00 $40.00 $30.00 | $2.,800.00 Eastman VC95 $60.00 $24.00 N/A $1,680.00
VIOLA (sizes TBD) 6 Canonici or Maple Leaf| ~ $19.95 $17.95 $15.95 $3,231.00 E““’g:s:gﬁ:;“‘"g $40.00 $25.00 $25.00 | $5,400.00 | Eastman VA100 $35.00 $14.00 N/A $2,940.00
VIOLIN % size 1 Canonici or Maple Leaf| ~ $17.95 $15.95 $13.95 $478.50 E““’g:s:gﬁ:;“‘"g $35.00 $20.00 $20.00 $750.00 Eastman VL100 $28.50 $11.50 N/A $400.00
VIOLIN % size 4 Canonici or Maple Leaf| ~ $17.95 $15.95 $13.95 $1,914.00 E““’g:s:gﬁ:;“‘"g $35.00 $20.00 $20.00 | $3,000.00 | Eastman VL100 $28.50 $11.50 N/A $1,600.00
VIOLIN full size 20 Canonici or Maple Leaf| ~ $17.95 $15.95 $13.95 $9,570.00 E““’g:s:gﬁ:;“‘"g $35.00 $20.00 $20.00 | $15,000.00 | Eastman VL100 $28.50 $11.50 N/A $8,000.00
BARITONE/ Yamaha YEP-201 Yamaha YEP-201 Yamaha YEP-201
3 Series 3 valve $81.95 $77.95 $73.95 $7,015.50 Series 3 valve No Bid No Bid No Bid Series 3 valve No Bid No Bid No Bid
EUPHONIUM X ) )
euphonium euphonium euphonium
Buffet Crampon Buffet Crampon
Buffet Crampon Premium Student Bb Premium Student Bb
Premium Student Bb Clarinet with Hite Clarinet with Hite
CLARINET 18 Clarinet with Hite $29.95 $27.95 $25.95 | $15,093.00 ! ! No Bid No Bid No Bid ! ! $45.00 $20.00 N/A | $11,700.00
Premi . Premiere Mouthpiece Premiere Mouthpiece
remiere Mouthpiece & N N N N
Rico clarinet neck strap. & Rico clarinet neck & Rico clarinet neck
strap. strap.
FLUTE 3 Powell Sonare 501 No Bid No Bid No Bid Powell Sonare 501 No Bid No Bid No Bid Powell Sonare 501 $115.00 $50.00 NA | $4950.00
Series SEeries SEeries
gggﬁw FRENCH 8 Eastman EFH 463 No Bid No Bid No Bid Eastman EFH 463 No Bid No Bid No Bid Eastman EFH 463 $137.50 $55.00 NA | $15,400.00
Ludwig 2.5 Octave Ludwig 2.5 Octave Ludwig 2.5 Octave
PERCUSSION 6  Xylophone Kit (must $33.95 $31.95 $2095 | ss75100 [XYlophoneKitmust] g gy No Bid No Bid Xylophone Kit (must | 10 iy No Bid No Bid
include pad, stand, case include pad, stand, include pad, stand,
and xylophone) case and xylophone) case and xylophone)
Yamaha YAS-26 Yamaha YAS-26 Yamaha YAS-26
Standard Alto Standard Alto . . . Standard Alto . . .
SAXAPHONE Saxophone with Hite $55.95 $53.95 $51.95 $14,566.50 Saxophone with Hite No Bid No Bid No Bid Saxophone with Hite No Bid No Bid No Bid
mouthpiece mouthpiece mouthpiece
TROMBONE 3 Yamaha YSL 354 $31.95 $29.95 $280 | s1040.85 | YomahaYSL 354 No Bid No Bid No Bid Yamaha YSL 354 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Student trombone Student trombone Student trombone
TRUMPET 6 Eastman ETR 420 No Bid No Bid No Bid Eastman ETR 420 No Bid No Bid No Bid Eastman ETR 420 $34.00 $14.00 N/A $2,880.00
Yamaha YBB- Yamaha YBB-
TUBA % size 5 Yamaha YBB-10SWC | ¢ ) o5 $154.95 $14695 | $2324250 |  105WC series, No Bid No Bid No Bid 105WC serics, No Bid No Bid No Bid
series, lacquered
lacquered lacquered
TUBA full size 1 King 2341 W series 4- $349.95 $324.95 $299.95 $9,748.50 |King 2341W series 4- No Bid No Bid No Bid King 2341W series 4- No Bid No Bid No Bid
valve, lacquered valve, lacquered valve, lacquered

*At end of year 2 CPS would own instrument




